University of the Philippines Mindanao

Mintal, Tugbok District, Davao City
Standard Form No. SF-GOOD 48

BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING SINGLE CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE BID
AND RECOMMENDING AWARD OF CONTRACT
Resolution No. 02, s. of 2018

WHEREAS, the University of the Philippines Mindanao, through its Bids and Awards Committee (BAC), posted the Invitation
to Bid for the bidding of the Supply of Books consisting of 171 titles with a total approved budget of Two Million Five
Hundred Eighty Seven Thousand Four Hundred Sixty One Pesos only (P2,587,461.00) in the PhilGEPS website, in the UP
Mindanao website, and in a conspicuous place in the premises of UP Mindanao continuously for seven (7) days;

WHEREAS, as a result of these postings one (1) bidder, Belview Co.Inc., purchased bid documents and submitted its bid upon
the deadline for submission on February 20, 2018;

WHEREAS, after the preliminary checking of the eligibility and technical requirements the lone bidder was found to be
eligible for bidding;

WHEREAS, upon opening of the financial envelope, the bid of Belview Co.

Inc. was read as follows:

Item L . Approved Bid Amount

No. Item Description Quantity Budget

1 1 5,776.00 4,620.00
Yee, Rendow. (2012). Architectural drawing: a visual
compendium of types and methods. 3rd ed. Hoboken: Wiley.
(ISBN-9780471796663 (pbk); (ISBN-0471793663

2 1 3,675.00 2,940.00
Adams, James L. (2001). Conceptual blockbusting: a guide to
better ideas. 4th ed. Perseus Books Group. (ISBN- 0738205370)

3 1 13,912.00 11,125.00
Antoniades, Anthony C. (1992). Poetics of architecture. New
York: Van Nostrand Reinhold. (ISBN-0442239904)

4 Bachelard, Gaston. (1994). The poetics of space. Reprint ed. ! 2,271.00 no bid
Boston: Beacon Press (ISBN-9780143107521(pbk) (ISBN-
0143107526)(pbk)

> Baker, Geoffrey H. (1996). Design strategies in architecture: an 1 18,554.00 14,840.00
approach to the analysis of form. London: F&N Spon (ISBN-
0747600414)

6 ) 1 17,736.00 no bid
Jenkins, Norman. (2008). Norman foster works 3. London: Prestel

7 1 66,975.00 no bid
Jenkins, Norman (2004). Norman foster works 4. London: Prestel

8 - - 1 9,607.00 7,685.00
Jodidio, Philip(2014). Tadao Ando: complete works. New York:
Taschen. (ISBN-9783836553940) (ISBN-3836553945)

9 1 11,280.00 9,020.00

Jones, John Chris. (1992). Design methods. 2nd ed. New York:
John Wiley and Sons. (ISBN-0471279587)
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Item . . Approved Bid Amount
No. Item Description Quantity Budget
10 1 . i
Lang, Jon (1987). Creating architectural theory. New York: Van 200.00 no bid
Nostrand Reinhold. (ISBN-0442259816 (pbk)
11 L. . 1 250.00 no bid
Lang, Jon. (1980). Designing for human behavior. Stroudsberg:
Hutchinson Ross (ISBN-0879330546)
12 IMcKim, Robert. (2005). Experiences in visual thinking. 2nd ed. 1 950.00 no bid
Boston: PWS. (ISBN-0818504110
13 Moore, Brooke. (2003). Critical thinking. 6th ed. New york: 1 22,325.00 17,855.00
McGraw-Hill (ISBN-9780078038280)(alk. paper)(ISBN-
0078038386) (alk paper)
14 1 4,225.00 no bid
Grondzik, Walter T. (2014). Mechanical and electrical equipment
for building. New york: Wiley (ISBN-9781118615904)(ISBN-
1118615905)
15 . . 1 9,746.00 7,795.00
Finkelstein, Allen (2016). AutoCAD 2016 an AutoCAD LT 2016.
New York: John Wiley & Sons (ISBN-9780470120491 (pbk)
(ISBN- 0470120495 (pbk)
16 . . 1 5,081.00 4,060.00
Middlebrook, Mark. (2013). AuCAD 2014 for dummies. New
York: Wiley (ISBN-1118603974
17 Tickoo, Sham. (2016). AutoCAD 2016: a problem solving 1 9,635.00 7,705.00
approach. Autodesk Press. (ISBN-1942689012)
18 1 3,000.00 2,400.00
Omura, Geroge. (2006). Just enough auto CAD 2007.
Indianapolis: Wiley (ISBN-9780470008782)(ISBN-0470008784)
19 Timothy, Sean Sykes. (2011). 3D autoCAD 2007: one step at a 1 6,108.00 4,885.00
time. Autodesk Press. (ISBN-0981986730)
20 | Clarke, Anthony. (1999). Managing health and safety in building| | 16,674.00 13,335.00
and construction. USA: Butterworth-Heinemann (ISBN-
07506400154)
21 1 16,448.00 13,155.00
Edison, Vernon. (2006). Handbook of OSHA construction safety
and health. 2nd ed. USA: CRC (ISBN-0849365465(hc) (ISBN-
9780849365461
2 Perezgonzales, Jose. (2005) Construction safety management: a ! 9,400.00 7,520.00
knowledge systems approach. USA: Lulucom (ISBN-
1411631234)
1 8,061.00 X
23 Perezgonzales, Jose (2005). Alternative way of managing health 6,445.00
and safety: USA: Lulu.com. (ISBN-1411634284
4 1 21,737. 7,385.
2 Reese, Charles (2004). Office building safety and health. 1st ed. 00 17,385.00
USA: CRC (ISBN-1566706831) (alk. paper)
2 1 ] .
> Reese, Charles. (2000). Material handling systems: designing for 3,596.00 no bid
safety and health. USA: CRC (ISBN-1560328681)(alk. Paper)
26 1 4 . i
Fry, Edwin Maxwell. (1982). Tropical architecture in the dry and 5,825.00 no bid
humid zones. 2nd ed. Krieger (ISBN-0898741262)
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Rosenthal, Peggy. (1984). Words and values: some leading words
and where they lead us. New York: Oxford University Press.
(ISBN-0195033647)(ISBN-9780761831020)

| Item . . Approved Bid Amount

No. Item Description Quantity Budget

27 1 7,039.00 5,630.00
Olgyay, Victor. (1991). Design with climate: bioclimatic approach
to architectural regionalism. Reprint ed. John Wiley & Sons.

(ISBN-9780691169736) (pbk) (ISBN-069116973X(pbk)

28 1 11,285.00 9,025.00
Emmanuel, Rohint. (2005). An urban approach to climate sensitive
design: strategies for the tropics. 1st ed. Taylor & Francis. (ISBN-
0415334098(hbk:alk.paper)(ISBN-0415334101(pbk:alk.paper)

29 . .
Koch-Nielsen, Holger. (2002). A design guide for the built 1 16,909.00 13,525.00
environment in hot climate . Earthscan

30 1 18,554.00 14,840.00
Bay, Joo Hwa. (2006). Tropical sustainable architecture: social
environmental dimensions. 1st ed. Architectural Press

31 'Hog, Froilan. (1999). Architects guide to climate design: Manila: 1 5,500.00 no bid
UAP

32 |Burling, Robbins. (1992). Patterns of language  structure, 1 1,145.00 no bid
variation, change. USA: Academic Press. (ISBN-0121449203
(acid-free paper)

33 1 250.00 no bid
Condon, John C. Jr. (1985). Semantics and communication. 3rd
ed. Hampshire, England: MacMillan. (ISBN-0023242000(pbk)

34 1 7,745.00 6,195.00
Ganske, Kathy. (2010). Word journeys: assessment guided phonics
spelling and vocabulary instruction. New York: The Guilford
Press. (ISBN-9781462512508)

35 Habernas, Jurgen. (2000). On the pragmatics of communication 1 7,990.00 6,390.00
studies in contemporary German social thought. Massachusetts:

MIT Press

36 1 2,292.00 no bid
Hayakawa, SI and Alan R. Hayakawa. (1989). Language in
thought and action. 5th ed. Kentucky: Heinle (ISBN-0156482401)

1 1 .00 i

37 Hppoer, Paul J. (1982). Tense, aspects, semantics and pragmatics: 3,510.0 no bid
typological studies in language. Amsterdam: John Benjamins

38 1 1,060.00 no bid
Lass, Roger. (1984). Phonology: an introduction to basic concepts.

UK: Cambridge. (ISBN-0521237289) (ISBN-0521281830)

39 Levinson, Stephen. (1984). Pragmatics. UK: Cambridge ! 10,370.00 8,295.00
University Press. (ISBN-0521294142)

40 McComb, Dave. (2003). Semantics in business system: the savvy 1 13,030.00 10,420.00
managers guide. San Francisco, Calif: Morgan Kauffman. (ISBN-

1558609172)
41 1 4,364.00 no bid
Roach, Peter. (2001). English phonetics and phonology audio CD:
a practical course: UK: Cambridge University Press.
(ISBN9780521717403)
42 1 2,410.00 no bid
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Item . . Approved Bid Amount
No. Item Description Quantity Budget
43 1 8,162.00 no bid
The handbook of morphology. (1997). UK: Blackwell, (ISBN-
9781107038271)(hbk:alk.paper)
44 Arnheim, Rudolf. (2004). Visual thinking. London: Faber & Faber 1 7,520.00 6,015.00
(ISBN-0520242262)
45 1 5,455.00 5,450.00
Arnheim, Rudolf. (1974). Art and visual perception: a psychology
of the creative eye. Berkeley: University of California Press.
(ISBN-0520023277)
46 . L 1 3,434.00 2,745.00
Edwards, Betty (2012). Drawing on the ride side of the brain. Los
Angeles. Jeremy P. Tarcher. (ISBN-978585429202)
47 . . . 1 3,897.00 3,115.00
Edwards, Betty. (1986). Drawing on the artists within. New York:
Simon and Schuster. (ISBN-9780671635145)
48 o . 1 1,460.00 no bid
Scott, Robert Gilliam. (1951). Design fundamentals. New York:
McGraw-Hill. (ISBN-0898740401)
49 1 870.00 no bid
Probst, Gilbert JB and Betina Butchel. (1997). Organizational
learning: the cooperative advantage of the future. NJ Prentice Hall.
(ISBN-01346223266)
50 1 14,867.00 11,890.00
Richmond, Virginia (et.al). (2004). Organizational communication
for survival making work. 3rd ed. Ma: Allyn and Bacon (ISBN-
9780205535057)(ISBN-0205535054)
51 1 1,710.00 no bid
Zalabak, Pamela S. (2001). Organizational communication:
knowledge, sensivity, skills and values. Ma: Allyn and Bacon
52 |Kiphan, Helmut. (2010). Handbook on print media: technologies 1 9,264.00 no bid
and production methods
53 |Ailes, Roger. (1995). You are the message. Garden City: 1 2,520.00 2,510.00
Doubleday. (ISBN-0385265425
54 1 1,055.00 no bid
Barton, Laurence. (1993). Crisis in organizations: managing and
communicating in the heat of chaos. Ohio: South-Western. (ISBN-
0538818182)
55 1 1,878.00 no bid
Chajet,clive. (1997). Image by design: from corporate vision to
business reality. New York: Addison-wesley. (ISBN-0201550423)
56 1 2,905.00 no bid
Dozier, David. (1995). Manager's guide to excellence in public
relations and communication management. Mahwah, NJ: LEAP
(ISBN-080581809X)(ISBN-0805818103)
57 L. . 1 3,026.00 3,025.00
Corporate communication: theory and practice. (1994). Albany:
SUNP. (ISBN-0791420558)(ISBN-0791420566)
58 1 2,225.00 no bid

Crisis response: inside stories on managing image under siege.
(1993). Detroit: Gale Research Institute. (ISBN-978080391307)
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Item
No.

Item Description

Quantity

Approved
Budget

Bid Amount

59

Munter, Mary. (1997). Guide to managerial communication. 4th
ed. Upper Saddle River, NJ: Prentice Hall. (ISBN-
9780132971331-pbk)(ISBN-013297133X) (pbk)

3,758.00

no bid

60

Riel, CBM van (1995). Principles of corporate communication.
London: Prentice Hall (ISBN-0131509969)

450.00

no bid

61

White, Jon. (1995). Strategic communications management:
making public relations at work. New York: Addison-wesley.
(ISBN-0201593769)

35,937.00

28,740.00

62

Neher, William H. (1997). Organizational communication:
challenges of change, diversity and continuity. Indiana: Butler
University. (ISBN-0205150063)

3,425.00

no bid

63

Numberg, Geoffrey. (2007). Going nucular language, politics and
culture in controversial times. Public Affairs

3,817.00

no bid

64

Leitch, Vincent. (2010). The norton anthology of theory and
criticism. 2nd ed. New York: WW Norton. (ISBN-
9780393393292 8)(ISBN-093932923)

7,953.00

7,900.00

65

Selden, Raman. (2010). The cambridge history of literary
criticism: vol. 8, from formalism to poststructuralism. Cambridge:
Cambridge University Press. (ISBN- 9780521317245)(ISBN-
2521317224X)

7,988.00

no bid

66

Propp, Vladimir. The morphology of the folktale. Bloomington,
Ind. : Research Center: Indiana University. (ISBN- 1614278008)
(ISBN-9781614278009)

2,574.00

no bid

67

Todorv, Tzvetan. (1975). The fanstatic: a structural approach to a
literary genre. Ind.: Research Center: Indiana University. (ISBN-
0826502459)(ISBN-9780801491467)

4,454.00

4,450.00

68

Andersen, Benedict. (1998). Spectre of comparisons. Manila:
ADMU Press. (ISBN-1859848133)(ISBN-1859841848)

7,039.00

7,000.00

69

Andersen, Benedict. (2006). Imagined communities: reflections on
the origin and spread of nationalism. London; New York: verso.
(ISBN-1844670864)(ISBN-971844670864)

3,046.00

3,045.00

70

Foucault, Michael. (1995). Discipline and punish: the birth of the
prison. New York: Vintage Book. (ISBN-0679752552)(ISBN-
9780679752554)

2,658.00

2,655.00

71

Foucault, Michael. (1990). The history of sexuality. Vol. 1. New
York: Pantheon Books. (ISBN-9780679724698)(ISBN-
0679724699)

2,294.00

no bid

72

Foucault, Michael. (1982). Archaeology of knowledge. (ISBN-
9780394711065)(ISBN-0394711068)

2,463.00

no bid
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Item e . Approved Bid Amount

No. Item Description Quantity Budget

73 |Barthes, Roland. ('1977). Imagine-music-text) (ISBN- 1 3,098.00 3,095.00
9780374521363)(ISBN-0374521360)

74 1 4,343.00 no bid
Derrida, Jacques. (1998). Writing and difference. Chicago:

University of Chicago Press. (ISBN-0226143295)(ISBN-
9780226143293)

75 . . 1 6,193.00 6,190.00
Bhabha, Homi K. (1994). The location of culture. London:

Routledge. (ISBN- 0415336392)(ISBN- 9780415336390)

76 1 3,995.00 3,990.00
Ashcroft, Bill. (2002). The empire writes back: theory and practice
in post colonial literatures.London; New york: Routledge. (ISBN-
0415280192)(ISBN-0415280206

77 1 5,396.00 5,395.00
Spivak, Gayatri. (1999). A critique of postcolonial reason: toward
a history of the vanishing present. Cambridge, Mass.: Harvard
University Press. (ISBN- 9780674177642)(ISBN-0674177649)

78 2,886. i
Moretti, Franco. (2013). Distant reading. London; New York: ! -886.00 no bid
Verso. (ISBN- 978178168084 1(ISBN-978781681121)

79 . 1 3,725.00 no bid
Moretti, Franco. (2007). Graphs, maps, trees: abstract models for
literary history. New York: Verso. (ISBN-1844671852)(ISBN-

9781844671854)

80 1 5,248.00 5,245.00
Jameson, Fredric. (1991). Postmodernism, or. The cultural logic of|
late capitalism. Durham: Duke University Press. (ISBN-
0822310902)91SBN-9780822310907)

81 Kurniawan, Eka. (2015). Beauty is a wound. New York: New 1 2,894.00 2,890.00
Directions. (ISBN-9780811223638)

82 Storey, John. (1994). Cultural theory and popular culture: a reader. 1 7,998.00 7,995.00
New York: Harvester Wheatsheaf. (ISBN-9781405874212)(ISBN-
140577421X)

83 1 150.00 no bid
Checkoway, Julie. (2001). Creating fiction. Cinncinati, Ohio:

Storey Press Books. (ISBN-9781884910517)(ISBN-1884910513)

84 1 10,796.00 8,635.00
Rizhon, Gerard. (2011). Voices from Sulu. Manila: ADMU Press.

(ISBN-971550616X)(ISBN-9789715506168)

85 1 2,500.00 2,000.00
Tolentino, Rolando. (2007). Sipat kultura: tungo sa
mapagpalayang pagbabasa, pag-aaral at pagtuturo ng panitikan.

Manila: ADMU Press. (ISBN-9789715505239)
1 4,213.00 bid

86 | Baum, Vicky. A tale from Bali. (ISBN-9789625935027) fo bt

87 . L 1 5,640.00 5,635.00
Lubis, Mochtar. Twilight in Jakarta. New York: Oxford University
Press. (ISBN-9786029144086)

88 1 2,879.00 2,875.00

Ananta, Pramoedya. This earth of mankind. New York: Morrow.
(ISBN-9780140256352)

Page 6 of 11




Item L. . Approved Bid Amount

No. Item Description Quantity Budget

89 1 9,628.00 i
Ahmad, Ahahnon. (1991). No harvest but a thorn. Petaling Jaya: no bid
Fajar Bakti. ISBN-967651540X)

90 1 . i
Burgess, Anthony. (1972). The malayan trilogy. Harmondsworth, 1,698.00 no bid
Eng. Penguin Books. (ISBN-9780749395926)

91 i
Korpjitti, Chart. (2001). The judgement. (ISBN-9789748793825) ! 16,039.00 no bid

92 1 8,990.00 8,975.
Renfew, Colin. (2016). Archaeology: theories, methods and 00
practice. New York: Thames and Hudson. (ISBN-9780500292105)

93 1 . i
Kadil, Ben J. History of the moro and indigenous peoples in 3:525.00 no bid
Minsupala.(ISBN-9715480047)

94 . . . . . 1 9,165.00 7,325.00
Abinales, Patricio. (2010). Orthodoxy nd history in the Muslim-

Mindanao narrative. Quezon City: ADMU Press. (ISBN-
9789715506007)

95 1 4,700.00 i
Donoso, Isaac. (2013). Islamic for east: ethnogenesis of Philippine no bid
Islam. Quezon City: UP Press (ISBN-9789715426671)

96 1 5,875.00 no bid
Ferrer, Mirriam.(2013). Costly wrs, elusive peace: collected
articles on the peace process in the Philippines 1990-2007. Quezon
City: UP Press

97 1 7,050.00 no bid
Political psychology of land conflict and peacebuilding in Central

Mindanao: a social representations approach. (2013). Quezon
City: IPCSSC;ADMU. (ISBN-9789718610626)
98 L . . . 1 2,350.00 no bid
Batad Ifugao dictionary with ethnographic notes. (1993). Manila:
Linguistic Society of the Philippines. (ISBN-971105924X0)
99 ) ) . e 1 3,525.00 no bid
Brainard, Sherri. (2002). A grammar of Yakan. Manila: Linguistic
Society of the Philippines. (ISBN971780012X)
100 1 2,145.00 bid
Eriksen, TH. (2001). Small places, ;arge issues. London: Pluto no ot
Press. (ISBN-0745317731)(ISBN-0745317723)

101 1 475.00 bid
Hymes, Dell. Reinventing anthropology. Ann harbor: Unibersity noot
of Michigan. (ISBN-0472086073)(ISBN-9780745335933)

102 1 5,875.00 bid
La Fontaine, J. (1985). What is social anthropology? London: E. no bl
Arnold. (ISBN-071316445X)

103 Conkil, Harol. (1980). Ethnographic atlas of Ifugao. (ISBN- ! 41,125.00 41,000.00
978030002593)(ISBN-0300025297)

104 1 2,350.00 bid
The teaching of visual anthropology. (1989). Firenze: Editrice II no bt
Sedicensimo. (ISBN-8885342035)

105 1 810.00 no bid

Crawford, Peter. (1992). Film as ethnograpgy. Manchester:
Manchester University. (ISBN-0719036828)(ISBN-0719036836)
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Item . . Approved Bid Amount

No. Item Description Quantity Budget

106 1 6,569.00 no bid
The agta people: a photographic depiction of the Casiguram Agta
People of Northern Aurora Province, Luzon Island, the
Philippines. (2011). Dallas, Texas: SIL International. (ISBN-

9781556712623)

107 i
Marcus, Geroge E. (1998). Ethnography through thick and thin. ! 1,175.00 no bid
New Jersey: Princeton

108 1 11,600.00 9,275.00
Knauft, Bruce M. (1996). Genealogies for the present in cultural
anthropology. New York: Routledge. (ISBN-0415912636)(ISBN-

0415912644)

109 1 9,705.00 ,760.
Bell, H. (2010). Management communication. New York: Wiley. 39,7050 31,760.00
(ISBN-9780470084458)

110 1 36,925. .
Adler, Donald D. (2012). Communicating at work: principles and 92500 29,515.00
practices for business and professions. 11th ed. New York:

McGraw-Hill. (ISBN-9780078036804)

111 . . 1 40,655.00 32,520.00
Meredith, Jack R.(2011). Project management: a managerial
approach. 8th ed. New York: Wiley. (ISBN-9780470533024)

112 1 2,860.00 2,855.00
Drucker, Peter F. (2006). Managing the non-profit organization.

Reprint ed. New York: Harper Business. (ISBN-9780060851149)

13 Besanko, David. (2012). Economics of strategy. 6th ed. New York: 1 13,865.00 11,000.00
Wiley. (ISBN-978118273630)

114 1 22,304.00 bid
Kotler, Philip. (2015). Marketing management. 15th ed. New noot
York: Person. (ISBN09780133856460)

115 Chopra, Sunil. (2016). Supply chain management: strategy, 1 3,636.00 no bid
planning and operations. 6th ed. India: Pearson. (ISBN-

9789332548237)

116 1 23,214.00 18,570.00
Murray, Michael. (2005). Econometrics: a modern introduction.
1st ed. New York: Pearson. (ISBN-9780321113610)

1 18,328.00 14,660.00

17 Hill, Carter. (2011). Principles of macroeconomics. 4th ed. New 83 ,660.0
York: McGraw-Hill. (ISBN-9780470626733)

118 [McConnel, Campbell. (2014). Econometrics: a modern 1 29,361.00 23,475.00
introduction. 20th ed. New York: McGraw-Hill. (ISBN-

9780078021756)

119 1 23,681.00 18,945.00
Mankiw, Gregory N. (2014). Principles of macroeconomics. 7th ’
ed. New York: Pearson (ISBN-9780132857123)

120 Pindyck, Michael. (2014). Microeconomics. 8th ed. New York: 1 12,925.00 no bid
Pearson. (ISBN-9780132857123)

121 1 4,367.00 no bid

Froeb, Luke M. Managerial economics: a problem solving

approach. 4th ed. USA: Learning (ISBN-

9781439077986)

Cengage
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Item e . Approved Bid Amount

No. Item Description Quantity Budget

122 1 24,688.00 no bid
Johnson, David B. (2015). Mathematics: a practical odyssey. 8th
ed. (ISBN-9781305104174)

123 1 29,441.00 23,550.00
Eves, Howard. (1990). An introduction to the history of
mathematics. 6th ed. Cengage Learning. (ISBN-9780030295584)

124 . 1 14,288.00 11,420.00
Kosmala, Witold. (1998). Advanced calculus: a friendly approach.
Prentice Hall. (ISBN9780137379255)

125 1 13,977.00 11,180.00
Ross, Kenneth. (2013). Elementary analysis: the theory of]
calculus(undergraduate texts in mathematics). 2nd ed. Springer.
(ISBN-9781491462705)

126 Thomson, Brian S. (et. al). (2008). Elementary real analysis. 2nd ! 21,627.00 17,295.00
ed. (ISBN-9781434843678)

127 Lo . i 1 8,707.00 no bid
Chuan-Chang, Chen. (1992). Principles and techniques in
combinations. (ISBN-9789810211141)

128 Hogg, R.V. (2012). Introduction to mathematical statistics. 7th ed. 1 29,796.00 23,825.00
(ISBN-9780321794710)

129 Mendenhall, William. (2008). Mathematical statistics with 1 72,620.00 50,800.00
applications. 7th ed.

130 Graybill, Mood. (2007). Introduction to the theory of statistics. ! 7,988.00 6,395.00
(ISBN-9780070445208)

131 . . 1 69,379.00 48,565.00
Giordano,& Weir & Fox. (2013). A first course in math modeling.
5th ed. Brooks Cole. (ISBN-9781285050904)

132 . . 1 14,688.00 11,750.00
Dekking (et.al). (2010). A modern introduction to probability and
statistics. (ISBN-9781849969529)

133 \Numerical analysis. (2010). Faires & Burden. (ISBN- 1 34,837.00 27,850.00
9780538733519)

134 Yu, Xinjie. (2010). Introduction to evolutionary algorithms. st ed. ! 39,543.00 31,630.00
(ISBN-9781849961295)

135 Winston, Wayne L. (2004). Operations research: applications and ! 49,661.00 35,000.00
algorithms. 4th ed. (ISBN-9780534380588)

136 Introductory time series with R. (2009). Springer. (ISBN- 1 12,017.00 9,610.00
9780387886978)

1 1 23,547.00 18,835.00

37 Young & Freedman. (2011). Sears and Zemansky's university ’

physics. 13th ed. Addison-wesley. (ISBN-9780321696861)

138 1 34,993.00 24,495.00
Physics for scientists and engineers. (2013) 9th ed. Serway &
Jewett. (ISBN-9781133954057)

139 ISchaum's outlines of college physics. (2011). 11th ed. Bueche & 1 15,925.00 12,735.00
Hecht.

140 1 14,815.00 11,850.00

Nisan, Noam. (et.al). Ed. (2007). Algorithmic game theory.
Cambridge  University  Press.  (ISBN-0521872820)(ISBN-
9780521872829)

Page 9 of 11




Item L . Approved Bid Amount

No. Item Description Quantity Budget

141
Shoham, Yoav. (2008). Multiagent systems algorithmic, game- ! 14,831.00 11,860.00
theoritic, and logical foundations. Cambridge University Press.
(ISBN-9780521899437)

142 ) 1 34,677.00 24,270.00
Watson, James D. (et.al). (2013). Molecular biology of the gene.
7th ed. (ISBN-9780321905376)

143 Molecular biology: genes to protein. 4th ed. Jones & Barlett. 1 39,939.00 27,955.00

(ISBN-9781449600921)

144 |Krebs, Jocelyn E. (2013). Lewin's genes XI. (ISBN- 1 22,622.00 18,075.00
9781449659851)

145 . . L. . L 1 43,541.00 30,475.00
Madulid, Domingo. (2000). A pictorial cyclopedia of Philippine
ornamental plants. Bookmark. (ISBN-9789715691437)

146 1 25,203.00 20,160.00
Alberts, Bruce (et.al). (2014). Molecular biology of the cell. 8th
ed. Garland. (ISBN-9780815344322)

147 1 1,833.00 no bid
Primavera, JH.& R.B. Sagada. Beach forests and mangrove
associates in the Philippines. SEAFDEC Aquaculture Department

148 Frodin, David. (2011). Guide to standard floras of the world. 1 44,650.00 31,250.00
(ISBN-97805211189774)

149 Gordon, Dudley (et.al.). (2012). Laboratory and field ! 20,692.00 16,500.00
investigations in marine life.. 10th ed. Jone and Barlett Learning.
(ISBN-9781449605018)

150 Ecology: from individuals to ecosystems. (2006). Wiley. (ISBN- 1 29,116.00 23,290.00
9781405111171)

151 1 77,640.00 54,345.00
Hartman and Kester's plant propagation: principles and practices.
(2010). Pearson. (ISBN-9780135014493)

152 Strickerberger, M. Onroe. (2015). Genetics. 3rd ed. Pearson. 1 9,163.00 7,325.00
(ISBN-9789332555105)

153 Tiz, Lincoln. (2010). Plant physiology. 5th ed. Sinauer Associates. ! 11,586.00 no bid
(ISBN-9780878938667)

154 Dakora, F. D. (2008). Biological nitrogen fixation: towards 1 57,183.00 45,745.00
poverty alleviation through sustainable agriculture. Springer.
(ISBN-9781402082528)

155 |Nielsen, S. Zusanne. (2014). Food analysis. 4th ed. Springer. 1 20,948.00 16,755.00
(ISBN-9781441914774)

156 . . . 1 14,803.00 11,840.00
Vaclavik, V. A. (2014). Essentials of food science.

. 1 79,195.00 55,435.00

157 Bellinghouse, VC. (2009). Food processing methods: techniques
and trends. (ISBN-9781606924143)

158 1 23,467.00 18,770.00

Bishop, Paul B. (2004). Pollution prevention: fundamentals and
practice. 1st ed. (ISBN-9781577663483)
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Item . . Approved Bid Amount
I
No. tem Description Quantity Budget
159 Hernandez-Sanchez. (2015). Food nanoscience and 1 30,315.00 24,250.00
nanotechnology(Food engineering series). Springer. (ISBN-
9783319135960)
160 1 26,670.00 21,335.00
Joshi, VK. (2011). Food processing waste management: treatment
and utilization technology. NIPA. (ISBN-9789380235592)
161 Salfinger, Yvonne. (2015). APH: a compendium of methods for 1 66,975.00 46,880.00
the microbiological examination of foods. APHA Press. (ISBN-
9780875532738)
162 1 26,658.00 21,325.00
Yousef, Ahmed D. (2003). Food microbiology: a laboratory
manual. Wiley. (ISBN- 9780471391050)
163 1 45,825.00 36,655.00
Smith, I. (2006). Improving traceability in food processing and
distribution. CRC Press. (ISBN-9781855739598
164 . . 1 86,245.00 60,370.00
Brennan, James J. (2011). Food rocessing handbook. Wiley.
(ISBN-9783527324682)
165 . 1 51,700.00 41,355.00
Vaconcellos, JA. (2003). Quality assurance for the food industry:
practical approach. CRC Press. (ISBN- 9780849319129)
166 |Lanscape architecture 12 7,992.00 no bid
167 |Bluprint 6 3,000.00 no bid
168 | Philippine Studies 4 5,000.00 no bid
169 |Asian Magazine for Human transformation 12 2,496.00 no bid
170 | Communication Arts 6 9,000.00 no bid
171 |Springer Japan Journal of Industrial and Applied Mathematics 4 18,906.00 no bid
(JJIAM)
TOTAL 2,587,461.00 1,662,465.00

WHEREAS, after thorough evaluation and post qualification of the technical specifications and other documents submitted by
the single bidder, its bid was found to be compliant to the requirements;

NOW, THEREFORE, we the members of the Bids and Awards Committee hereby resolve:

1. To declare Belview Co., Inc. as the Single Calculated and Responsive Bid for the Supply of Library Books and recommend it
for award of the contract to supply the 102 titles for which it has submitted its bid amounting to One Million Six Hundred Sixty
Two Thousand Four Hundred Sixty Five Pesos Only (P1,662,465.00).

2. The Committee also resolved to recommend the use of Small ValueProcurement for the remaining items consisting of 69
titles with a total approved budget of P454,403.00.

RESOLVED at the Information and Technology Office, G/F Administration Building, UP Mindanao, Mintal, Davao City on 28

Februa

18.

Mr. MICHAEL A. GATELA

Alternate Member

Prof. V,

BAC

&\—9“3
Ms. EMMA KUTH'B. CAALAMAN

BAC Member

Approved: W
E B. CALAG Prof. SYLVIA B. CONCEPCION

ai Chancellor

Prepared by: SB Acn.za-Head, BAC Secretariat
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