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BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING LOWEST CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE BID
AND RECOMMENDING AWARD OF CONTRACT
Resolution No. 01, s. of 2018

WHEREAS, the University of the Philippines Mindanao, through its Bids and Awards Committee (BAC), posted
the Invitation to Bid for the bidding of the Supply of Laboratory Equipment-Laminar Flow Hood, Sterilizer,
Automated Dispenser, pH Meter, Magnetic Stirrer, Top Loading Balance and Water Distillation System with an
approved budget of One Million Six Hundred Ten Thousand Pesos only (P1,610,000.00) in the PhilGEPS
website, in UP Mindanao website, and in a conspicuous place in the premises of UP Mindanao continuously for
seven (7) days;

WHEREAS, as a result of such postings six (6) bidders purchased bid documents and submitted their bids upon
the deadline for submission on February 20, 2018;

WHEREAS, after the preliminary checking of the eligibility and technical requirements all the bidders were
found to be eligible for bidding;

WHEREAS, upon opening of the financial envelopes the bids were read as follows:

Elmar Krypton Elite Scientific Gilmed Fil-Anaserve, Yana
Item | Description Approved | Marketing | Industrial Diagnostic Enterprises Inc. Chemodities
No Budget Resources Corp.
1 \Laminar Flow | 360,000.00 |351,700.00 | 356,000.00 | 359,610.00 No bid No bid 573,000.00

Hood - 2 units

2 |Glass Bead 100,000.00 | 98,560.00 | 76,000.00 No bid 80,000.00 | 93,440.00 97,960.00
Sterilizer -2pcs

3 |Automated 500,000.00 | No bid 180,000.00 No bid 473,900.00 No bid 424,800.00
Dispenser-2pcs

4 jpH Meter —2pcs | 120,000.00 | 85,000.00 | 54,000.00 No bid 68,000.00 | 100,000.00 | 21,800.00

5 Hot Plate / 120,000.00 | 84,500.00 | 40,000.00 No bid 118,000.00 | 101,920.00 | 60,000.00
Magnetic
Stirrer — 2pcs

6 |Top Loading 60,000.00 | 54,280.00 50,000.00 No bid 59,000.00 55,037.00 23,600.00
Balance — 1 unit

7 |Water Distillation | 350,000.00 | 328,450.00 | 130,000.00 No bid 305,000.00 | 185,000.00 | 128,800.00
System — 1 unit

TOTAL 1,610,000.00

WHEREAS, after thorough evaluation and post qualification of the technical specifications and other documents
submitted by the various bidders, the following are the findings:

1. For Item 1-Laminar Flow Hood, the bid submitted by Elmar Marketing, the lowest bidder, was found to be
non-compliant, while the bid of the next lowest bidder, Krypton Industrial Resources was found compliant and
responsive to the specifications;

2. The bid submitted by Krypton Industrial Resources, the lowest bidder for Item 2-Glass Bead Sterilizer was
found to be compliant and responsive;
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3. The bid submitted by Krypton Industrial Resources, the lowest bidder for Item 3-Automated Dispenser, was
found to be non-compliant to the specifications, while the bid of the next lowest bidder, Yana Chemodities, was
found to be compliant and responsive to the specifications;

4. For Item 4-pH Meter, the bid of Yana Chemodities, the lowest bidder for this item was found non-compliant to
the specifications while the bid of the next lowest bidder, Krypton Industrial Resources, was found to be
compliant and responsive;

5. The bids submitted by Krypton Industrial Resources, Yana Chemodities, and Elmar Marketing who submitted
the lowest, second lowest, and third lowest bids respectively, for Item 5-Hot Plate/Magnetic Stirrer, were found to
be non-compliant while the bid of Fil-anaserve Inc., the next lowest bidder, was found to be compliant and
responsive;

6. For Item 6-Top Loading Balance, the bids submitted by Yana Chemodities, Krypton Industrial Resources, and
Elmar Marketing, the three lowest bidders, their respective bids were all found to be non-compliant to the
specifications while the bid of Fil-Anaserve Inc., the next lowest bidder, was found to be compliant and
responsive;

7. Lastly, for Item 7-Water Distillation System, the lowest bid, second lowest, and third lowest bid were from
Yana Chemodities, Krypton Industrial Resources, and Fil-Anaserve Inc., respectively, were found to be non-
compliant to all the specifications while the bid of Gilmed Enterprises, the next lowest bidder, was found to be
compliant and responsive;

NOW, THEREFORE, we, the members of the Bids and Awards Committee hereby resolve to declare the following
as the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid (LCRB) for the items and with bid prices shown below:

Lowest Calculated and
Item Description Approved Budget Responsive Bidder
No (LCRB) Bid Amount
1 Laminar Flow Hood — 2 units 360,000.00 Krypton Industrial 356,000.00
Resources
2 |Glass Bead Sterilizer -2pcs 100,000.00 Krypton Industrial 76,000.00
Resources
3 | Automated Dispenser-2pcs 500,000.00 Yana Chemodities 424,800.00
4 pH Meter — 2pcs 120,000.00 Krypton Industrial 54,000.00
Resources
5 Hot Plate / Magnetic Stirrer — 2pcs 120,000.00 Fil-Anaserve, Inc. 101,920.00
6 Top Loading Balance — 1 unit 60,000.00 Fil-Anaserve, Inc. 55,037.00
7 Water Distillation System — 1 unit 350,000.00 Gilmed Enterprises 305,000.00
TOTAL 1,610,00.00 1,372,757.00
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RESOLVED at the Information and Technology Office, G/F Administration Building, UP Mindanao, Davao City,
on February 27, 2018.

EMMA RUTH B. CAALAMAN MICHAELA. GATELA
Member Alternate Member

Approved:

VICENTE B. AG, MSCS, MICT SYLVII( B. CONC;PCION, Ph.D.
‘A air ﬁ Chancellor

Note:

Prof. Cleto L. Nafola, Prof. Dominica DM Dacera (substituted by Mr. M. Gatela) and Prof. Virginia Obsioma have
classes/meetings at the College of Science and Mathematics.



