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BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING LOWEST CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE BID
AND RECOMMENDING AWARD OF CONTRACT
Resotution No. 30, s. of 2017

WHEREAS, the University of the Philippines Mindanao, through its Bids and Awards Committee (BAC),
posted the Invitation to Bid for the bidding of the Supply of Laboratory Equipment consisting of six (6) lots
with an approved budget of Three Million Sixty Six Thousand Pesos only (P3,066,000.00) in the PhilGEPS
website, in UP Mindanao website, and in a conspicuous place in the premises of UP Mindanao continuously
for seven (7) days; however, the total budget was reduced to P2,766,000.00 since Lot 6 with approved budget
of P300,000.00 was deleted per Bid Bulletin 01-2017;

WHEREAS, as a result of such postings two (2) bidders, namely, Instrumix Supplier Inc. and Yana
Chemodities, purchased bid documents and submitted their bids upon the deadline for submission on
December 12, 2017;

WHEREAS, after the preliminary checking of the eligibility and technical requirements the two bidders were
both found to be eligible for bidding;

WHEREAS, upon opening of the financial envelopes the bids were read as follows:

Lot No Description Approved Budget | Instrumix Supplier Yana Chemodities
Bid Amount Bid Amount

i Biosafety Cabinet & Microbial 950,000.00 No bid 552,200.00
Incubator

2 { UV VIS Spectrophotometer, etc. 1,356,000.00 1,351,000.00 No bid

3 | Hotplate with stirrer, Top Load- 245,000.00 No bid 238,800.00
ing Balance, Hotplate

4 | Gel Electrophoresis and Water 155,000.00 No bid 135,650.00
Bath with shaker and temperature

5 Respirometer 60,000.00 No bid No bid
TOTAL 2,766,000.00 1,351,000.00 926,650.00

WHEREAS, after thorough evaluation and post qualification of the technical specifications and other
documents submitted by Yana Chemodities for Lots 1, 3, and 4, its bid was found to be compliant and
responsive while the bid for Lot 2 of Instrumix Supplier Inc. was likewise found to be compliant and
responsive to the technical specifications;

NOW, THEREFORE, we, the members of the Bids and Awards Committee hereby resolve the following:

1. To declare Yana Chemodities as the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid for Lots 1, 3, and 4 with a total
bid amount of P926,650.00;

2. To declare Instrumix Supplier Inc. as the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid for Lot 2 with a bid amount
of P1,351,000.00;
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3. To recommend both bidders for award of contract for the lots indicated above.

RESOLVED at the Gaisano Conference Room, 2/F Administration Building, UP Mindanao, Davao City, on

December 21, 2017, W‘/

N
tEmLl. NMOVA ppp, DOMINICA DM DACERA, Ph.D,
Member Member
Approved:
VICENTE B. AG, MSCS, MICT SYLVIA B.'CONC:?CION, Ph.D.

ir Chancellor



