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" Iniversity of the Philippines Mindanao
Mintal, Tugbok District, Davao City
Standard Form No. SF-GOOD 48

BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING LOWEST CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE BID AND
RECOMMENDING AWARD OF CONTRACT
No. 2016-31

WHEREAS, after conducting two failed biddings, the University of the Philippines Mindanao, through
its Bids and Awards Committee, posted the Notice for Negotiated Procurement of the Supply of Multi-
parameter Portable Meter, pH Pen, Dissolved Oxygen Meter, Refractometer, pH Meter and Other
Laboratory Equipment for DBSES, with an approved budget amounting to Five Hundred Eighty Five
Thousand Pesos (P585,000.00) in the PhilGEPS website, the UP Mindanao website, and in a

conspicuous place in the premises of the University of the Philippines Mindanao continuously for seven
(7) days;

WHEREAS, as a result of these postings five (5) bidders submitted their bids upon the deadline for
submission on November 18, 2016;

WHEREAS, after preliminary checking of the required documents cons?sting of SEC or DTI
Registration, Valid Mayor's Permit, Audited Financial Statement, NFCC or CLC, Technical

Specifications, Bid Form, and Certificate of PhilGEPS registration, all the bidders were found to be
eligible;

WHEREAS, upon opening of the financial proposals their bids were read as follows:

i Approved Cebu Far Harnwell |Scigate Paddington |Mars
o Budget for  |Eastern Drug | Chemicals |Technology |Trading Laboratory
| ltem Description the Contract |Inc. Corporation Instruments
" Center
1. Multi-parameter 330,000.00 | 225,000.00 |250,000.00| 262,000.00 No bid 115,720.00

(portable) Meter

2. pH pen with electrode | 60,000.00 28,500.00/ No bid 50,000.00 No bid 72,500.00
bench type unit

|
3. Dissolved oxygen 60,000.00 28,000.00/ No bid No bid 54,000.00 58,6004007
meter unit
4. Refractometer 45,000.00 15,000.00/ | 34,500.00 No bid 44,062.50 67,800.00
unit
5. pH Meter 30,000.00 7,000.00/ | 25,500.00 No bid 30,000.00 26,250.00
unit
6. pH Meter (water) 30,000.00 No bid 25,500.00 No bid 219,591.87 | 26,250.00
7. pH Meter (soil) 30,000.00 25,000.00/ | 30,000.00 No bid No bid 24,000.00
L unit

WHEREAS, upon thorough evaluation and post qualification of the technical specifications and bid

documents submitted by the bidders for the corresponding items listed below their bids were found to be
compliant and responsive, to wit:




"™ oved Budget for the | Lowest Calcula. ~d
‘ o Contract Responsive Bid
ftem Description \ Amount of Bid '
1

1. Multi-parameter 330,000.00 Mars Laboratory 115,720.00
(portable) Meter Instruments Center
2. pH pen with electrode 60,000.00 Scigate Technology Corp 50,000.00
1 bench type
| 3. Dissolved oxygen 60,000.00 Paddington Trading \ 54,000.00
Irleter ‘ f?
4. Refractometer 45,000.00 Harnwell Chemicals T 34,500.00

5. pH Meter 30,000.00 Cebu Far Eastern Drug 7,000.00/unit or

21,000.00 4
25,500.00

6. pH Meter (water) ‘ 30,000.00 Harnwell Chemicals
| 7. pH Meter (soil) \ 30,000.00 Mars Laboratory \ 24,000.00
| o
\ TOTAL \ 585,000.00 * ’ \ 324,720.00 ‘
R — T

NOW, THEREFORE, we, the members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby resolve to
recommend the award of contract to the lowest calculated and responsive bid for each item listed above;

RESOLVED on 12 December 2016 at the SOM C-4, Ground Floor Administration Building, University
of the Philippines Mindanao, Mintal, Tugbok District, Davao City.

~ A

Ms. EMMA RUTH B CAALAMAN Prot. gRWIN €, PROTACID
BAC Member BAC Member

Prof. ANTONIO R. OBSIOMA
BAC Chair

Approved:

Prof. SYLVIA B. CON:‘EPCION

Chancellor
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