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Mintal, Tugbok District, Davao City
Standard Form No. SF-GOOD 48

BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING LCRB AND RECOMMENDING AWARD OF CONTRACT
No. 2016-37

WHEREAS, after two failed biddings the University of the Philippines Mindanao, through its Bids and
Awards Committee, posted the Notice for Negotiated Procurement of the Supply of Software, Computer,
Printer, Copier, GPS, Fixtures & Furniture, Appliances and Other Equipment with an approved budget of
Three Million Seven Hundred Fifty Four Thousand Pesos Only (P3,754,000.00) in the PhilGEPS website, in
the UP Mindanao website, and in a conspicuous place in the premises of the University of the Philippines
Mindanao continuously for seven (7) days;

WHEREAS, as a result of such postings five (5) bidders submitted their price quotations and other
requirements upon the deadline on 8 December 2016,

WHEREAS, upon preliminary checking of the required documents consisting of SEC Registration,
Mayor's Permit, Audited Financial Statement, NFCC, Technical Specifications, Bid Form and Certificate of
PhilGEPS Registration all of the five bidders were found eligible for bidding;

WHEREAS, upon opening of the financial proposals the bid prices were read as follows:

Item Description Approved Gakken Photopro Copylandia | Philcopy Corp | Philippine
Budget Duplicators

Lot 1-Software 839,500.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

Lot 2-Computer 819,000.00 No bid No bid No bid _ Nobid No bid

Lot 3-Printer 209,500.00 No bid 180,946.00 No bid No bid No bid

Lot 4-Copier 805,800.00{ 518,888.85 585,991.00 645,000.00 674,901.60 748,000.06‘“

Lot 5-GPS 45,000.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

Lot 6-Fixtures 494,200.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

Lot 7-Appliances 541,000.00 No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid

TOTAL 3,754,000.00

WHEREAS, upon thorough evaluation of the eligibility, technical and financial documents submitted by
Photopro, the lone bidder for Lot 3 — Printer, its bid was found to be non-compliant and non-responsive to
the specifications;

WHEREAS, upon thorough evaluation of the eligibility, technical and financial documents submitted by
Gakken and Photopro, the lowest and second lowest bids, respectively, for Lot 4 — Copier, both of them
were found to be non-compliant and non-responsive to the technical specifications; however, upon thorough
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evaluation of the technical specifications submitted by the next bidder, Copylandia, its bid was found to be
compliant and responsive to the requirements;

NOW, THEREFORE, we, the members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby resolve to award the
contract for the supply of Lot 4 -Copier to Copylandia with a contract amount of Six Hundred Forty Five
Thousand Pesos Only (P645,000.00);

RESOLVED on 21 December 2016, 2/F Administration Building, University of the Philippines Mindanao,
Mintal, Tugbok District, Davao City.

BAC Member

>

Prof. ANTONIO R. OBSIOMA
BAC Chair

Approved:

Prof. SYL61A B. C':,;NCEPCION

Chancellor

Note: Prof. E. Protacio and Ms E. Caalaman were absent..



