University of the Philippines Mindanao
Mintal, Tugbok District, Davao City
Standard Form No. SF-GOOD 48

BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING SCRB/LCRB FOR LOTS 1 AND 5, DECLARING FAILURE
OF BIDDING FOR LOTS 2,3,4,6,7, 8,9 & 10 AND RECOMMENDING APPROVAL
No. 2016-09

WHEREAS, the University of the Philippines Mindanao, published the Invitation to Bid of the Supply of
Equipment for the Modernization of IT Teaching, Research and Classroom Equipment and Equipment to
Furnish New Building consisting of ten (10) lots with a total budget of Eight Million One Hundred Four
Thousand Two Hundred Pesos Only (P8,104,200.00) in the Manila Bulletin, a newspaper of nationwide
circulation; posted the same in the PhilGEPS website, in the UP Mindanao website, and in a conspicuous
place in the premises of the University of the Philippines Mindanao continuously for 7 days;

WHEREAS, as a result of such advertisements four prospective bidders purchased bid documents but only
three (3) submtted their bid documents on 15 June 2016;

WHEREAS, upon preliminary checking of the eligibility and technical documents submitted by the three
bidders all of them were found to be eligible for bidding;

WHEREAS, upon preliminary checking and opening of the financial proposals of the three bidders their
bids were read as follows:

Lot Particulars Approved Budget (| Air Gakken Phils, Better
No. ABC) Prosystems Inc. Components
1 |Aircon 3,490,000.00| 3,267,737.44 No bid No bid
Responsive Bid
2 |Software 533,000.00 No bid No bid No bid
3 |Computers 825,000.00 No bid No bid No bid
4 |Printers and Copiers 1,315,800.00 No bid 1,227,666.55 No bid
NON RESKONSIVE
5 |Projectors 268,000.00 No bid 266,887.00 218,444.39
Responsive Bid | Non-Responsive
Bid
6 |GPS 45,000.00 No bid No bid No bid
7 |Camera 105,000.00 No bid No bid No bid
8 [Sound System and Conference 335,000.00f No bid 321,718.00 287,771.77
System Non-Responsive | Non-Responsive
Bid Bid
9 |Fixtures and Furniture 494,200.00 No bid No bid No bid
10 |Appliances &other Equipment 693,200.00 No bid No bid No bid
TOTAL ' 8,104,200.00
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BAC Resolution No 2016-09

WHEREAS, upon thorough evaluation and post qualification of the eligibility, technical and financial
documents submitted by AirPro Systems, the lone bidder for Lot 1, its bid was found to be compliant and
responsive to the specifications;

WHEREAS, upon thorough evaluation and post qualification of the eligibility, technical and financial
documents submitted by Gakken Phils., Inc, the lone bidder for Lot 4, its bid was found to be non-compliant
and non-responsive to the specifications;

WHEREAS, upon thorough evaluation and post qualification of the eligibility, technical and financial
documents submitted by Better Components, the lower of two bids received for Lot 5, its bid was found to
be non-compliant and non-responsive to the specifications; but upon thorough evaluation and post
qualification of the eligibility, technical and financial documents submitted by the next bidder, Gakken
Phils., Inc. its bid was found to be compliant and responsive to the specifications;

WHEREAS, upon thorough evaluation and post qualification of the eligibility, technical and financial
documents submitted by Better Components and Gakken Phils., Inc, the two bidders for Lot 8, both their
bids were found to be non-compliant and non-responsive to the specifications;

NOW, THEREFORE, we, the members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby resolve to declare the
following:

1. Declare Air Prosystems as the Single Calculated and Responsive Bid (SCRB) for Lot 1 and recommend it
for award of the contract amounting to P3,267,737.44;

2. Declare Gakken Phils., Inc. as the Lowest Calculated and Responsive Bid (LCRB) for Lot 5 and
recommend it for award of the contract amounting to P266,887.00;

3. Declare failure of bidding for Lots 2, 3, 4, 6, 7, 8, 9, and 10 with a total approved budget amounting to
P4,346,200.00 and recommend a second bidding.

RESOLVED on 29 July 2016, 2F Administration Building, University of the Philippines Mindanao, Mintal,
Tugbok District, Davao City.

Ms. EMM&;HI B. CAALAMAN Prof. ERWIN E. PROTACIO

BAC Member BAC Member

Prof. CLETO L. NANOLA, JR.
BAC Member

Approved:

Prof. ANTONIO R. OBSIOMA
BAC Chair Prof. SYLVIA B. CONCEPCION

Chancellor

MTE: PROF. PROTACIO v PROF. NRNOLA WENE A&cead.



