University of the Philippines Mindanao
Mintal, Tugbok District, Davao City
Standard Form No. SF-GOOD 48§

BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING LOWEST CALCULATED AND RESPONSIVE BID AND

RECOMMENDING AWARD OF CONTRACT
No. 2017-07

WHEREAS, after two failed biddings the University of the Philippines Mindanao, through its Bids and
Awards Committee (BAC), posted the Notice for Negotiated Procurement for the Supply of Software,
Computers, Printers, Furniture and Fixtures with an approved budget amounting to P2,766,199.98 in the
PhilGEPS website, the website of UP Mindango and in conspicuous place in the premises of the
University of the Philippines Mindanao continuously for seven (7) days;

WHEREAS, as of the opening of bids on 21 March 2017 at 9:00 AM three (3) bidders submitted their
sealed price quotations with the required documents and upon preliminary checking of the eligibility
requirements all of them were found eligible for bidding;

WHEREAS, upon opening of the financial proposals the following were the bid prices as read:

Item Description 1 Quantity Approved Columbia Ng Khai S1
Budget Technologies
1. AutoCAD LT 2016 5 375,000.00 172,500.00 190,200.00 No bid
2. Sketch Up Pro License 4 148,000.00 No bid 165,000.00 No bid
3. V-Ray 2.0 for Sketch Up 4 172,000.00 No bid 189,200.00 No bid
4. Office Home & Student 12 84,000.00 55,200.00 60,120.00 51,600.00
2016 Perpetual License

5. Desktop Computers 3 109,999.98 103,500.00 No bid 104,070.00
6. Netbook 1 20,000.00 14,500.00 No bid 12,990.00
7. Ultrabook Laptop 2 110,000.00 111,600.00 No bid 89,980.00
8. High Performance Laptop 2 130,000.00 No bid No bid 105,980.00
9. Branded High Performance 4 288,000.00 No bid No bid 221,960.00

Desktop

10. Branded Desktop Computer 2 125,000.00 116,000.00 No bid 107,470.00
11. Laptop 1 95,000.00 No bid No bid 73,110.00
12. Laser Printer 1 15,000.00 9,900.00 No bid 7,650.00
13. Laser Printer 1 8,000.00 6,800.00 No bid 7,650.00
14. Multifunction Colored Laser 1 45,000.00 24,800.00 No bid 32,990.00
Printer '

15. Printer 3 60,000.00 56,400.00 No bid 48,870.00
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Item Description Quantity Al;proved Columbia Ng Khai S1
Budget Technologies

16. A3 Laser Printer 1 84,000.00 No bid No bid No bid
17. GPS 1 45,000.00 No bid No bid No bid
18. Steel Filing Cabinet 1 24,000.00 No bid No bid No bid
19. Steel Filing Cabinet 8 54,200.00 No bid No bid No bid
20. Clerical Table 2 10,000.00 No bid No bid No bid
21. High Backrest Chair 4 10,000.00 No bid No bid No bid
22. Classic Monoblock Chairs 40 28,000.00 No bid . No bid No bid
without armrest

23. Executive Chairs 10 38,000.00 No bid No bid No bid
24. Classic Monoblock Chairs 40 50})00.00 No bid No bid No bid
with armrest

25. Sofa Set 1 40,000.00 No bid No bid No bid
26. Study Table 10 70,000.00 No bid No bid No bid
27. Refrigerator 7 cu ft. 1 11,000.00 No bid No bid No bid
28. Microwave 3 17,000 00 No bid No bid No bid
29. Evaporative Air Cooler 3 60,000.00 No bid No bid No bid
30. Double Door Refrigerator 1 65,000.00 No bid No bid No bid
31. Chest-type Freezer 1 60,000.00 No bid No bid No bid
32. Refrigerator 1 60,000.00 No bid No bid No bid
33. Smart TV 3 150,000.00 No bid No bid No bid
34. Wall Fans 2 6,000.00 No bid No bid No bid
35. Stand Fan 6 16,000.00 No bid No bid No bid
36. Paper Shredder 4 46,000.00 No bid No bid No bid
37. Paper Shredder 1 37,000.00 No bid No bid No bid

WHEREAS, upon thorough evaluation and post qualification of the technical specifications submitted by
the bidders for the items indicated below, their bids were found to be within the approved budget and
compliant to the specifications, namely:
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Item Description Quantity| Approved Lowest Calculated Bid Amount
Budget and Responsive Bidder
1. AutoCAD LT 2016 5 375,000.00 Columbia Computer 172,500.00
4, Office Home & Student 12 84,000.00 S1 Technologies 51,600.00
2016 Perpetual License

5. Desktop Computers 3 109,999.98 Columbia Computer 103,500.00
6. Netbook 1 20,000.00 S1 Technologies 12,990.00
7. Ultrabook Laptop 2 110,000.00 S1 Technologies 89,980.00
8. High Performance Laptop 2 130,000.00 S1 Technologies 105,980.00
12. Laser Printer 1 15,000.00 S1 Technologies 7,650.00
13. Laser Printer 1 8,000.00 Columbia Computer 6,800.00
14. Multifunction Colored Laser Printer 1 45,000.00 S1 Technologies 32,990.00
15. Printer 3 60,000.00 Columbia Computer 56,400.00
TOTAL 1,331,999.98 640,390.00

NOW, THEREFORE, we, the members of the Bids and Awards Committee, hereby resolve to declare
Columbia Computer as the winning bidder for Items 1 - AutoCAD, 5 — Desktop Computers, 13 — Laser
Printer, and 15- Printer and likewisie to declare S1 Technologies as the winning bidder for Ittems 4 -
Office Home & Student Perpetual License, 6 — Netbook, 7-Ultrabook Laptops, 8 — High Performance
Laptops, 12 — Laser Printer, and 14- Multifunction Colored Printer;

It was also resolved that the remaining items (Items 2, 3, 9, 10, 11, and 16-37) that were not awarded will be
reviewed by the end user units for possible adjustments in the technical specifications and/or approved budget
prior to another posting in the PhilGEPS website.

RESOLVED on 30 March 2017 at the Gaisano Conference Room, 2/F Administration Building,
University of the Philippines Mindanao, Mintal, Tugbok District, Davao City.

7
Ms. EM.P&QJTH B.C

AMAN Prof. VIRGINIA P. OBSIOMA

BAC Member BAC Member
Prof. DOMINICA DM. DACERA Prof.mm. SALAZAR
BAC Member BAC Chair

Approved:

Prof. SYLVIA B. ;?ONCEPCION

Chancellor



