University of the Philippines Mindanao ,
Mintal, Tugbok District, Davao City
Standard Form No. SF-GOOD 48

BAC RESOLUTION DECLARING LOWEST CALCULATED BID AND RECOMMENDING
AWARD OF CONTRACT
Resolution No. 22, s. of 2017

WHEREAS, the University of the Philippines Mindanao, through its Bids and Awards Committee (BAC), posted
the Invitation to Bid for the bidding of the Supply of Various Equipment consisting of 17 lots with a total
approved budget amounting to One Million Three Hundred Fifty Four Thousand Nine Hundred Thirty Nine
Pesos Only (P1,354,939.00) in the PhilGEPS website, in the website of UP Mindanao, and in a conspicuous
place in the premises of UP Mindanao continuously for seven (7) days;

WHEREAS, as a result of such postings two bidders purchased bid documents and submitted their bids on
September 18, 2017, the deadline for submission of bids;

P

WHEREAS, upon opening and preliminary checking of the eligibility and technical requirements of the twc
bidders, Goldman Enterprise and NR Eustaquio Enterprises, Inc., both of them were found to be eligible for
bidding;

WHEREAS. upon opening of the financial envelope and reading of the bids of the two bidders, the following were
their bids as read by the BAC, namely:

Lot Description Approved Budget!| NR Eustaquio Goldman
No Enterprise (
1 Digital Voice Recorder 48,000.00 No bid 47,975.00 ‘
3z Buili-in Speaker & wireless microphone 157,600.00 No bid No bid |
3 Steel Filing Cabinets 107,000.00 No bid No bid
4 Conterence Table with two shelves 121,000.00 No bid No bid
5 One Seater Sofa, Center Table 26,000.00 No bid No bid j
' |
6 Refrigerator 20,000.00 No bid 19,995.00 !
7 Rotzzing Ceiling Fan 10,000.00 No bid 9,980.00
§  Ar Conditioning Unit 37,000.00 No bid No bid ’
S Brznded Video Camera with tripod 55,000.00 No bid No bid
& Wzter Dispenser | 8,000.00 No bid 7,995.00 i
Lignmweight Pole Pruner 33,000.00 No bid No bid
1Z  Proector. Laprop, Branded Desktop 157,400.00 No bid 157,360.00
Compuzer. Flatbed Scanner, Printer
I3 Pmoector with screen, Laptop ' 169,551.00 No bid 169,491.00
I2  &-m-One Printer Ink Tank System 25.000.00 22,550.00 ; 22,990.00

/
)

randed Deskrop Computers 143.000.00 No bid 144.969.00




